4/24/2026

2026 Union County Asphalt Materials Quotations
Tabulation

Contact Phone Number

Asphalt Materials, Inc
940 N Wynn Rd.
Oregon, OH 43616

419-693-0626

Shelly Materials, Inc.
1700 Fostoria Ave
Ste 200, PO Box 3100
Findlay, OH 45840

419-422-8854

Shelly Materials, Inc.
1700 Fostoria Ave
Ste 200, PO Box 3100
Findlay, OH 45840

419-422-8854

Strawser Construction Inc.
dba Terry Asphalt Materials
8 Standen Drive Hamilton,
OH 45015

513-874-6192

Decker Materials Company
3042 McKinley Ave.
Columbus, OH 43204

614-488-7958

Unique Paving Materials

Contact Name Cameron Porter Scott Rychener Scott Rychener David Kiser Carl W. Scheiderer
Belle Center Ostrander 4/16/2026-12/15/26 12/16/2026-4/30/27
ITEM 301 Bit Agg Base No Bid $82.00 $78.50 No Bid $95.00 $145.00 No Bid
ITEM 302 Bit Agg Base No Bid No Bid $78.50 No Bid $95.00 $145.00 No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 (Int) No Bid $92.00 $91.50 No Bid $95.00 $145.00 No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 2 No Bid $84.00 $84.50 No Bid $95.00 $145.00 No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 (Surface) No Bid $92.00 $91.50 No Bid $95.00 $145.00 No Bid
Asphalt Cold Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $155.00 $155.00 $138.00
MC-30 $4.250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RS-2 $2.390 No Bid No Bid $2.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
CM-90 $3.250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HFRS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) $2.290 No Bid No Bid $2.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
RS-2P (SBR-latex) $2.290 No Bid No Bid $2.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRS-2P (SBR-latex) $2.174 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CSS-1H (50% diluted Fog Seal) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FAST DRYING FOG SEAL $1.940 No Bid No Bid $1.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
CM-150# $3.550 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CM-300 $3.600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineered Recycling Emulsion,
Cold Central Plant $3.250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mixing Plant Mix $4.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mixing Plant Mobilization $1,500.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premium for Supply Bond $0.000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Demurage Rate $150.00 $100.00
o, Mareta
Source of Supply Toledo Terry Asphalt Materials
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