



**County Engineer
Environmental Engineer**

233 W. Sixth Street
Marysville, Ohio 43040
P 937. 645. 3021
F 937. 645. 3161

www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer

Building Department

233 W. Sixth Street
Marysville, Ohio 43040
P 937. 645. 3018

Marysville Operations Facility

16400 County Home Road
Marysville, Ohio 43040
P 937. 645. 3017
F 937. 645. 3111

Richwood Outpost

190 Beatty Avenue
Richwood, Ohio 43344

Public Service with integrity

MEMO

TO: Board of Commissioners
FROM: Jeff Stauch
DATE: April 17, 2025
SUBJECT: Asphalt Material Quotes received April 9, 2025

The referenced quotations are summarized on the attached tabulation. We recommend that all quotations be accepted.

We expect to purchase materials from the suppliers as follows (subject to availability, performance and compliance with our specifications):

RS-2P (SBR-latex)	Asphalt Materials, Inc.	\$2.189
CRS-2P (SBR-latex)	Asphalt Materials, Inc.	\$2.189
CSS-1H	Asphalt Materials, Inc.	\$1.519
Fast Dry Fog Seal	Asphalt Materials, Inc.	\$1.519

Items 301-441 Shelly and Sands, Inc.

We will purchase any other materials from other suppliers as necessary (subject to availability, performance and compliance with our specifications).

C.J. 2025
Date 4/23/2025

2025 Union County Asphalt Materials Quotations Tabulation

Contact Phone Number Contact Name	Asphalt Materials, Inc. 840 N Wynn Rd Oregon, OH 43616	Shelly Materials, Inc. 1700 Fostoria Ave Ste 200, PO Box 3100 Findlay, OH 45840	Shelly Materials, Inc. 1700 Fostoria Ave Ste 200, PO Box 3100 Findlay, OH 45840	Strawser Construction Inc. dba Terry Asphalt Materials 18 Standen Drive OH 45015	K-Tech Specialty Coatings PO Box 20 Ashley, IN 45705	Decker Materials Company 3042 McKinley Ave Columbus, OH 43204		Shelly and Sands, Inc. 1515 Harmon Ave. Columbus, OH 43223	Hel Way LLC 290 N Pike Rd Savner, PA 16055
						4/9/2025-12/15/2025	12/16/2025-4/30/2026		
	419-693-0626 Cameron Porter	419-422-8654 Scott Rychener Belle Center	419-422-8654 Scott Rychener Ostrander	515-874-6192 David Kiser	260-587-9113 John Baumgartner	614-488-7858 Carl W. Schneider	740-310-2988 Marty Spring	724-353-2700 Ella Helman	
ITEM 301 Bit Agg Base	No Bid	\$76.00	\$78.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$140.00	\$73.00	No Bid
ITEM 302 Bit Agg Base	No Bid	\$76.00	\$78.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$140.00	\$73.00	No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 (Int)	No Bid	\$88.00	\$91.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$140.00	\$85.00	No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 2	No Bid	\$78.00	\$84.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$140.00	\$76.00	No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 (Surface)	No Bid	\$88.00	\$91.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$140.00	\$85.00	No Bid
Asphalt Cold Mix	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	\$150.00	No Bid	\$147.00
MC-30	\$4.300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RS-2	\$2.080	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CM-50	\$3.150	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.271	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFRS-2P (SBS)	\$2.350	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RS-2P (SBS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2P (SBS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HFRS-2P (SBR-latex)	\$2.189	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RS-2P (SBR-latex)	\$2.189	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2P (SBR-latex)	\$2.189	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CSS-1H (60% diluted Fog Seal)	\$1.519	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FAST DRYING FOG SEAL	\$1.519	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CM-150#	\$3.500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CM-300	\$3.550	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Engineered Recycling Emulsion, Cold Central Plant	\$3.130	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mixing Plant Mix	\$3.500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mixing Plant Mobilization	\$1,250,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Premium for Supply Bond	\$0.000	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Demurrage Rate	\$150 per hour Oregon, Edison, Columbus, Marietta, or Toledo			\$125 per hour	\$135 per hour			60 Tons	23 ton minimum
Source of Supply		Belle Center	Ostrander Plant		K-Tech Specialty Coatings			Plant 1	