UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2024 May 1, 2024

RESOLUTION NO. 24-228:

Approve the Recommendation of the Union County Engineer to Accept All Asphalt Material Quotes Received April 17, 2024 – Engineer

The Board of County Commissioners approved the recommendation of the Union County Engineer to accept all asphalt material quotes received April 17, 2024:



County Engineer
Environmental Engineer

Mary admirates 15040 P 0.2 vis 5021 F 0.2 vis 5021

AND RESIDENCE STREET, CONTRACT

Building Department

222 W. Ston Street Maryor dle Olmo (2010) p. 027–625 2018 Marysville Operations Facility

163903 cont. Henry Read Way code, Ohio 15049 p. 937-645-5617 p. 937-645-5441

Richwood Outpost

190 Se ny ly ende Richwood Ohio 15511

Public Service and ordered

MEMO

TO:

Board of Commissioners

FROM:

Jeff Stauch

DATE:

April 24, 2024

SUBJECT:

Asphalt Material Quotes received April 17, 2024

The referenced quotations are summarized on the attached tabulation. We recommend that all quotations be accepted.

We expect to purchase materials from the suppliers as follows (subject to availability, performance and compliance with our specifications):

RS-2P (SBR-latex) Asphalt Materials, Inc. \$2.50
CRS-2P (SBR-latex) Asphalt Materials, Inc. \$2.40
CSS-1H Asphalt Materials, Inc. \$1.63
Fast Dry Fog Seal Asphalt Materials, Inc. \$1.63

Items 301-441

Shelly Materials Inc.

We will purchase any other materials from other suppliers as necessary (subject to availability, performance and compliance with our specifications).

UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2024 May 1, 2024

	Asphal Vateria's Inc 940 N Wynn Rd Diegon, OH 438 S	Shelly Materials inc 1700 Fostoria Ave Ste 200 Finday, OH 45840	Shary Marghais inc 1771 Harmon Ave Columbus OH 43223	Stanisie Construction Inc. dta Terry Aspriat Maleria's 5600 Sidvien 9Vd Hamilton OH 45015	Unique Paving Materials 3993 E 63rd St Creverand, Ort. 44105	Philips Dil Co Of Central Onio 1877 McKinley Ave Columbia OH 43204	; K-Tech Specially Coaling PO Box 4-13 Ashley, N 46705
Contact Phone Number	413 693 2026	10-422 0854	514 437 2359	513 874 6192	215-941-4501	67# 27# 2517	269-587 9***
Contact Name	Carrena Palar	Scott Sychiner	Troy Segrer	Argentiate	Daniel Factories	Microel Worker	Jann Baumparner
		Sera Coner	Distancer				
ITEM 301 9d Agg Base	No Bid	\$75.0C	\$76 50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Did
ITEM 307 81 Agg Base	No Bra	976.00	\$76.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 Inti-	No Bid	987.00	\$89.50	No ∄d	No Bel	No Bid	No Brd
iTEM 441 Type 2	No Bid	471.00	\$82.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bld	No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 (Surface)	No Bid	\$81.00	\$89.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bia
Asphair Cold Mix	No Ed	No Usd	No 84	No 8 d	\$137.50	\$145.00	No Isia
MC-30	\$4.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Noted	No Bid	No Bid
RS-2	\$2.39	No 9 d	No Bid	\$2.43	No Bid	No Bid	52 51
CM-90	\$3.52	No Brd	No Eid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bra
HFRS-2P (SBS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Sid	No 5 d	Na Bid	12.66
RS-20'(SRS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No liid	No 3-a	No 8 d	52:44
CRS-2P (SBS)	No Bed	DIE QN	No Bid	No 8 d	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.06
HERS-OP (J.BR-4400)	32.50	No 5 d	Vo Bid	\$2.70	No 8id	No Bid	No Bit
RS-2P (SER-aVex)	\$2.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$2 70	No Rig	Ng ji rj	No this
CRS-2P (SSR latox).	\$2.40	No Bid	No 9id	\$2.70	No 8-11	No Bid	No 3id
SS-1H 150% dauled Fog	\$1.63	No B d	No Bid	No 9id	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
FAST DRIVING FOG SEAL	\$1.63	No Big	No Bld	\$1.66	No Bid	No Bid	52.15
Premium for Supply Bond	No Bid	No Bid	No 8rd	190,08	No 8 d	No.Bid	No Sel
			No 84d	\$0.66 \$125.00	No 8:4	No.Bd	51

4/25/2024

A motion was made by David A. Lawrence and seconded by Steve Robinson to approve this resolution and was carried by the following vote:

Steve Robinson, Yea David A. Lawrence, Yea

* * *

(This portion of the page intentionally left blank.)