VOLUME 2024 PAGE 1345
UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2024
May 1, 2024

RESOLUTION NO. 24-229:

Approve the Recommendation of the Union County Engineer that All 2024 Aggregate And
Concrete Quotations Received April 10, 2024, be Accepted and that the Unit Purchases be Awarded

on that Basis — Engineer

The Board of County Commissioners approved the recommendation of the Union County Engineer that
all 2024 Aggregate and Concrete Quotations received April 10, 2024, be accepted and that the unit
purchases be awarded on that basis:
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April 24, 2024

Board of Commissioners
Union County, Ohio

233 W. 6th Street
Marysville, Ohio 43040

RE: Aggregate and Concrete 2024 Unit Prices
Quotations received April 10, 2024

Commissioners:

Attached is a tabulation of the Union County 2024 Aggregate and Concrete Quotations.

Because of the suppliers’ proximity to the various locations of work in Union County, we recommend
that all the quotations received be accepted and that the unit purchases be awarded on that basis.

Sincerely,

1]

Jeff Stauch
Union County Engineer
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2024 Union County Aggregate Materials Quotation Tabulation

Shelly Materials Sheily Materialy Dbt Quarry, Inc National Lime & Stone (thlo Ready-Kilx, Inc.
York Center Quarry Befle Center Quarry Plant: 9042 51 fr 117 Plant: 2406 S. Section Line Flant: 24515 Honda Pawy
28855 SR 739 1558 CR 108 Huntawille, CH 53324 Delaware, OH 43015 {Maryswlie, OH 43020
West Mansfield, OH 43358 Setle Cénter, DH 43310 (9375362831 740-369-7651 9316861313
937-358-2224 937-464-3832 ). Seozt Duff Scott Flores I Seon Oull
Shawn Scott Shawn Scott
Findlay_
#1 No Bid No 3:d No Bid No Bid No sid'
|
H2 $15.50} No 8id 518.25 $24.00) No Bid
1
LL] 515.50] No Bid $18.35) 524 60| No Bud|
|
ILypeA Rip Rap No 8id No Bid 530.75 No 8.4 No Bid|
|
Type B Rip Rap Mo Bid| Mo Bid $30./% No 8id No 8id}
Type C Rip Rap $32.00 No Bid $30.75 No 8id No eﬂ!
Type D Rip Rap 531.00 No Bid $30.75 No 8id No 8id|
]
ns? 518 25} No Bid] $19.50] $28.00; No 8id|
#8 $19.75 No 8 526 04| $33.00 No Bid{
Ko : 514.00) 514 00) $17.5d $24.00 No 8.4
Item 304 513.251 No Bid $1750 523.00, No Bid)
Item 310 513 25| No Bid 517.50] No Bid No Bid)
ttam 411 $13.25) No Bid 51150 52300 No Bd
703,10 Sesennings 512,001 Mo B 51700 52100 No Bid|

2024 Union County Aggregate Materials Quotation Tabulation

SAND l No 8.d| No Bid $24.75 523 GJ No 8id
MASON SAND [ 544 CC‘I No Bid $41.00 No D'dil No Bid
FILTER SAND No Bid N’D_Bu! No Bid| No Bid| No 8id
DIRT Mo Bid No Bid No 8id No Budl Na 8id
HB9 . No Bid, No Bid No Blj Ng B|u| No Bid
RAP I No fid No Bid _NoBid} No 8id No Bid
304 Recycled concrele No 2id] No Bid No fid} Na Bid No Bid)
617 Mo Bid No B.d| No Bid No Bid No Bld‘
QC1 CONCRETE No 8id| No Bid No Bid| No Bid| S!SO.Dﬂj
QC2 CONCRETE No BidI No Bid No Bid} No 8id| $134.5¢
CDF FLOW MIX Mo Bid No Bid No 3Id NDQ $132 50!
Surge Rock

Delivery Fees

A motion was made by David A. Lawrence and seconded by Steve Robinson to approve this resolution
and was carried by the following vote:
Steve Robinson, Yea

David A. Lawrence, Yea
% k %



