
Asphalt Materials, Inc                          
940 N Wynn Rd.                                 

Oregon, OH   43616 

Shelly Materials, Inc.                           
1700 Fostoria Ave             

Ste 200                            
Findlay, OH  45840

Shelly Materials, Inc.                              
1771 Harmon Ave                 

Columbus, OH 43223

Strawser Construction Inc.           
dba Terry Asphalt Materials                

8600 Bidstein Blvd.               
Hamilton, OH  45015

Phillips Oil Co. 
Of Central Ohio

1877 McKinley Ave.         
Columbus, OH  43204

Contact Phone Number 419-693-0626 419-422-8854 614-437-2359 513-874-6192 614-274-2657

Contact Name Cameron Porter Scott Rychener Troy Segner Andrew Nortz Michael Wurster

Belle Center Ostrander

ITEM 301 Bit Agg Base No Bid $73.00 $76.50 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 302 Bit Agg Base No Bid $73.00 $76.50 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 441 Type 1 ( Int) No Bid $85.00 $89.50 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 441 Type 2 No Bid $76.00 $82.50 No Bid No Bid

ITEM 441 Type 1 (Surface) No Bid $85.00 $89.50 No Bid No Bid

Asphalt Cold Mix $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$135.00 FOB Plant

$150 Delivered

MC-30 $4.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RS-2 $2.13 No Bid No Bid $2.43 No Bid

CM-90 $3.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

HFRS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

RS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CRS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) $2.43 No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid

RS-2P (SBR-latex) $2.43 No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid

CRS-2P (SBR-latex) $2.33 No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid

CSS-1H (50% diluted Fog Sea $1.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FAST DRYING FOG SEAL $1.63 No Bid No Bid $1.66 No Bid

Premium for Supply Bond $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Demurage Rate $150.00 $125.00

Source of Supply Edison Ohio Terry Asphalt Materials
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