UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2023 April 26, 2023

Unofficial BID TABULATION 2023 UNI PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS-BOX BEAMS Opens March 29, 2023 2 3 3 m.m.								
Cottopeny Name	Proposal Amount for CR 175-0.386 Le Masters Road 7 bosms — 817-48 x 28° 0"	Proposal Amount for GR 138A-1,467 Daver-County Line Road 7 beams - 812-48 x 31° 0°	Proposal Amount for CR 128A-1.043 Hillway Road 48 linear fact of 10" x 4" 4 elded box culvert	Proposal Amount for CR 3-9-286 Buller Avenue 93 Deser feet of 12° x 6° 4 sided box culvert	Preposal Amount for CR 182-0.840 Maple Dell Road 63 Samer feet of 16" z 4" 4 elded box culvers	Propose) Amount for CR 2280-2-183 Rapp-Date Road 45 ligaer feet of 10" x 8" 4 sided bus culvert		
Alam Stone Company P.O. Box 186 WMsamstown, WV 26167	\$73,150.00 \$10,450/bach	\$73,850.00 \$10,550/each	\$49,720 00 \$1,015/FT	\$75,000 00 \$1,25QFT	\$99,225 00 \$1,575/FT	\$55,880 00 \$1,160/FT		

A motion was made by David A Lawrence and seconded by Dave Burke to approve this Resolution and was carried by the following vote:

> Dave Burke, Yea David A. Lawrence, Yea

RESOLUTION NO. 23-187:

Approve the Recommendation of the Union County Engineer That All Asphalt Material Quotes Be Accepted – Engineer

The Board of Commissioners approved the recommendation of the Union County Engineer that all asphalt material quotations be accepted:



County Engineer **Environmental Engineer Building Department** 233 W. Sixth Street Marysville, Ohio 43040 P 937, 645, 3018 F 937 645 3161 www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer

Marysville Operations Facility 16400 County Home Road Marysville, Ohio 43040 P 937, 645, 3017 F 937 645 3111

Richwood Outpost 190 Beatty Avenue Richwood, Ohio 43344

Public Service with integrity

MEMO

TO:

Board of Commissioners

FROM:

Jeff Stauch

DATE:

April 21, 2023

SUBJECT:

Asphalt Material Quotes received April 19, 2023

The referenced quotations are summarized on the attached tabulation. We recommend that all quotations be accepted.

We expect to purchase materials from the suppliers as follows (subject to availability, performance and compliance with our specifications):

RS-2P (SBR-latex)

Asphalt Materials, Inc.

Fast Dry Fog Seal

CRS-2P (SBR-latex) Asphalt Materials, Inc. CSS-1H Asphalt Materials, Inc. Asphalt Materials, Inc.

Items 301-441

Shelly Materials Inc.

We will purchase any other materials from other suppliers as necessary (subject to availability, performance and compliance with our specifications).

UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2023 April 26, 2023

and theates ne	Sharp Materials Inc.			
Ingur 211 43648	Fredhy Chr. +584C	Sharly Malamete, Fre. 1771 Martines Brid. Criticis in CH ANZIS	Figurer Countration inc. she Terry Papillat Malarian WID System Hosp Hamphor UN 15015	STREET CRICS OF CASHI CHIS 1877 MARKET ANS COUNTAIN OF EXOS
416-023-07-09	215 CT 2150	\$14.855.750	5134794133	8442742832
Common Restor	Term Avahasar	See Septem	44,900 MC	brist and Westpar
	Balla Contar	Cabalan		
No.Ekf	373.00	3/M.50	No.04	10.00
Na 812	\$73.00	\$24.50	No Clid	NuBe
No file	\$65.00	585.50	No list	No.86
No 84	\$76.00	\$82.50	No Est	No. Re
No 201	\$46.00	\$10.10	No dec	30.20
\$135.00	No Bill	No Bid	No Bet	\$156 30 F(08 Previ \$100 Delberoid
\$4.12	No the	No Dio	36 860	No Bid
\$2.15	No Bid	his Hall	32.17	No Bid
A5.42	No Bril	No Bid	No Rd	No Est
No Bid	No 845	No Ref	No Bit	PAN ENT
No 863	145 844	he se	No Bid	291 (015
No that	No Bit	No Bid	No Bid	Min Skip
62 43	For this	No tivi	\$2,70	res pad
\$2.43	rer Had	No Ess	\$2.70	rás Pad
\$2.33	Na Bld	Fan Phil	62 73	Fés 1965
31.63	No Did	No Dirt	No Del	Fes P65
11.50	No file	No Fed	\$1.99	No.761
£0 00	40.64	No 868	NO 05	No D-3
3150.00			B125 00	
Edwar Ohn			Terry Asukati Mikemia	
	No 853 No 854 62 63 82 43 82 23 91 64 91 53 60 00	No B5 No B6	No 653 No 864 No	No E55

A motion was made by David A. Lawrence and seconded by Dave Burke to approve this Resolution and was carried by the following vote:

Dave Burke, Yea David A. Lawrence, Yea

* * *

(This portion of the page intentionally left blank.)