

UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2023
April 26, 2023

* * *

RESOLUTION NO. 23-185:**Approve the Recommendation of the Union County Engineer That All Aggregate and Concrete 2023 Unit Price Quotations Be Accepted – Engineer**

The Board of Commissioners approved the recommendation of the Union County Engineer that all aggregate and concrete 2023 unit price quotations be accepted:



**County Engineer
Environmental Engineer
Building Department**
233 W. Sixth Street
Marysville, Ohio 43040
P 937. 645. 3018
F 937. 645. 3161
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer

Marysville Operations Facility
16400 County Home Road
Marysville, Ohio 43040
P 937. 645. 3017
F 937. 645. 3111

Richwood Outpost
190 Beatty Avenue
Richwood, Ohio 43344

Public Service with integrity

April 21, 2023

Board of Commissioners
Union County, Ohio
233 W. 6th Street
Marysville, Ohio 43040

RE: Aggregate and Concrete 2023 Unit Prices
Quotations received April 5, 2023

Commissioners:

Attached is a tabulation of the Union County 2023 Aggregate and Concrete Quotations.

Because of the suppliers' proximity to the various locations of work in Union County, we recommend that all the quotations received be accepted and that the unit purchases be awarded on that basis.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in blue ink, appearing to read "Jeff Stauch". The signature is written in a cursive style with a large initial "J".

Jeff Stauch
Union County Engineer

UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2023
April 26, 2023

2023 Union County Aggregate Materials Quotation Tabulation

	Shelly Materials York Center Quarry 28855 SR 739 West Mansfield, OH 43358 937-338-2224 Shawn Scott	Shelly Materials Belle Center Quarry 2558 CR 105 Belle Center, OH 43310 937-616-3811 Shawn Scott	Shelly Materials Distancer Quarry 8938 Watsons Rd Cincinnati, OH 43061 740-666-5841 Shawn Scott	Duff Quarry, Inc Plant: 9042 St Rt 117 Huntsville, OH 43026 937-688-2811 J. Scott Duff	National Lime & Stone Plant: 2406 S. Section Line Delaware, OH 43015 740-959-7651 Scott Flores Findlay	Luckeye Ready Mix LLC Plant: 818 N. Main St. Marysville, OH 43040 614-426-6438 Vern Flawin	Ohio Ready-Mix, Inc Plant: 24515 Honda Pkwy Marysville, OH 43040 937-686-4313 J. Scott Duff
#1	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
#2	\$14.25	no bid	\$16.00	\$14.25	\$22.00	no bid	no bid
#4	\$14.25	no bid	\$18.00	\$14.25	\$22.00	no bid	no bid
Type A Rip Rap	no bid	no bid	\$36.00	\$29.50	\$33.00	no bid	no bid
Type B Rip Rap	no bid	no bid	\$36.00	\$29.50	\$33.00	no bid	no bid
Type C Rip Rap	\$29.00	no bid	\$36.00	\$29.50	\$33.00	no bid	no bid
Type D Rip Rap	\$28.00	no bid	\$36.00	\$29.50	\$33.00	no bid	no bid
#57	\$16.75	no bid	\$23.00	\$16.25	\$25.00	no bid	no bid
#8	\$18.00	\$20.00	\$30.00	\$21.75	\$31.00	no bid	no bid
#9	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$12.75	\$13.25	\$22.00	no bid	no bid
Item 304	\$12.00	no bid	\$14.00	\$14.25	\$21.00	no bid	no bid
Item 310	\$12.00	no bid	no bid	\$14.25	no bid	no bid	no bid
Item 411	\$12.00	no bid	\$14.00	\$14.25	\$21.00	no bid	no bid
703-10 Screenings	\$11.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$19.00	no bid	no bid
SAND	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$21.00	no bid	no bid
MASON SAND	\$40.00	no bid	\$45.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
FILTER SAND	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

2023 Union County Aggregate Materials Quotation Tabulation

DIRT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
#69	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
RAP	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
304 Recycled concrete	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
#17	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
QC1 CONCRETE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$167.75 per CY	\$170.50 per CY
QC2 CONCRETE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$131.50 per CY	\$124.50 per CY
CDP FLOW MIX	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$123.50 per CY \$V 185	\$222.50 per CY
Surge Rock	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Delivery Fees						2 CY Minimum 2.0-\$ 0.00 per load	Minimum load under 5 yards is \$200

A motion was made by David A. Lawrence and seconded by Dave Burke to approve this Resolution and was carried by the following vote:

Dave Burke, Yea
David A. Lawrence, Yea

* * *