
    

Alan Stone Company
P.O. Box 186
Williamstown, WV 26187

Mack Industries, Inc.                                                    
201 Columbia Rd.                                       
Valley City, OH  44280

Prestress Services                                 
250 N. Hartford Ave.                                 
Ste 310                                    
Columbus, OH  43222                          

Double Z Construction Company
2550 Harrison Rd.
Columbus, OH 43204                        

No Bid$65,800.00
$9,400/each

$87,500.00
$12,500/each

$100,100.00
$14,300/each No Bid No Bid No Bid

$49,280.00
$1,120/each

$67,900.00
$9,700/each

$98,000.00
$14,000/each

$105,000.00
$15,000/each No Bid

$56,700.00
$8,100/each

$79,800.00
$11,400/each

$87,850.00
$12,550/each

$44,000.00
$1,100/each

No Bid No Bid $22,560.00
$564 per foot

Proposal Amount for                  
CR 299F-5.586 
Osborne Road

40 linear feet of 10’ x 4’ 4 sided 
box culvert 

Company Name

Proposal Amount for                                 
TR 167D-2.388 

West Darby Road
7 beams – B12-48 x 18’ 0”

Proposal Amount for                         
CR 289B-1.377 

Powder Lick Road
7 beams – B27-48 x 30’ 0”

Proposal Amount for                                 
CR 289A-0.802 

Powder Lick Road
7 beams – B27-48 x 23’ 0” 

Proposal Amount for                  
CR 205F-4.364 

Wheeler-Green Road
44 linear feet of 12’ x 4’ 4 sided 

box culvert 

$31,812.00
$723 per foot

$63,840.00
$1,140/each

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

Proposal Amount for                  
TR 158A-0.113 

Holycross-Epps Road
56 linear feet of 12’ x 6’ 4 sided 

box culvert 

$38,920.00
$695 per foot No Bid

No Bid

          Unofficial BID TABULATION 
2022 UNI PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS/BOX BEAMS 

Opens February 23, 2022  @ 11:00 a.m. 

Proposal Amount for                  
CR 344B-1.316 
Lingrell Road

144 linear feet of 60” reinforced 
concrete circular pipe

$49,680.00
$345/each

2/23/2022
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