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Public Service with integrity      
MEMO 

TO: Board of Commissioners 

FROM:  Jeff Stauch  

DATE:   March 30, 2021 

SUBJECT:   2021 Union County Precast Bids Received March 17, 2021. 
 
We have reviewed the referenced bids.  The above referenced bid tabulation is listed below. 

Company 
Name 

Proposal 
Amount for                                 
TR 109-
0.245 

Jolly Road                                                                                              
(7 beams – 
B12-48 x 27’ 
0”) 

Proposal 
Amount for                                 
CR 49B-0.995 

Hawn Road                                                                                        
(7 beams – 
B27-48 x 55’ 
0” ) 

Proposal 
Amount for                         
CR 2B-0.400 

Hyland-
Croy Road                                                                                         
(60 linear 
feet of 12’ x 
6’ 4 sided 
box culvert) 

Proposal 
Amount for                  
CR 29A-
0.170 

Crottinger 
Road                                                                                    
(50 linear 
feet of 16’ x 
5’ 4 sided 
box culvert) 

Proposal 
Amount for                  
CR 128C-
1.857 

Hillview 
Road                                                                                 
(40 linear 
feet of 12’ x 
5’ 4 sided 
box culvert) 

Proposal 
Amount 
for                  
TR 243-
0.930 

Morse 
Road                                                                                       
(96 linear 
feet of 60” 
reinforced 
concrete 
circular 
pipe) 

Mack 
Industries, 
Inc.                                                     

 No Bid  No Bid $32,280.00 
$538.00 

each 

$39,950.00 
$799.00 

each 

$23,720.00 
$593.00 

each 

No Bid 

Prestress 
Services 

$84,000.00 
$12,000.00 

each 
 

$140,000.00 
$20,000.00 

each 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Lindsay 
Precast                                       

No Bid  No Bid  $34,797.00 
$579.95 

each 

$39,980.00 
$799.60 

each 

$22,548.00 
$563.70 

each 

No Bid 

 
All bids were signed and contained proper surety. I recommend that any informalities be waived, and 
the bids be awarded to:   



 
County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street P  937. 645. 3018 
Environmental Engineer Marysville, Ohio 43040 F  937. 645. 3161 
Building Department   www.co.union.oh.us/engineer 

Prestress Services in the amount of $84,000.00 for proposal TR 109-0.245; 
 

Prestress Services in the amount of $140,000.00 for proposal CR 49B-0.99;5 
 

Mack Industries, Inc., in the amount of $32,280.00 for proposal CR 2B-0.400; 
 
 
Mack Industries, Inc., in the amount of $39,950.00 for proposal CR 29A-0.170; 
 
 
Lindsay Precast in the amount of $22,548.00 for proposal CR 128C-1.857.                                                
 
 


