Unofficial BID TABULATION

2021 UNI PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERTS/BOX BEAMS
Opens March 17, 2021 @ 10:00 a.m.

Company Name

Proposal Amount for
TR 109-0.245
Jolly Road
(7 beams — B12-48 x 27° 0")

Proposal Amount for
CR 49B-0.995
Hawn Road
(7 beams — B27-48 x 55’ 0" )

Proposal Amount for
CR 2B-0.400
Hyland-Croy Road
(60 linear feet of 12' x 6' 4
sided box culvert)

Proposal Amount for
CR 29A-0.170
Crottinger Road
(50 linear feet of 16’ x 5" 4 sided
box culvert)

Proposal Amount for
CR 128C-1.857
Hillview Road
(40 linear feet of 12' x 5' 4 sided
box culvert)

Proposal Amount for
TR 243-0.930
Morse Road
(96 linear feet of 60" reinforced
concrete circular pipe)

Alan Stone Company

Capital City Group Inc
2299 Performance Way
Columbus OH 43207

Carr Concrete
P.O. Box 265
Waverly, WV 26184

Forterra Building Products
1500 Haul Road
Columbus, OH 43207

Lindsay Precast
PO Box 578
Canal Fulton, OH 44614

No Bid

No Bid

$34,797.00
$579.95 each

$39,980.00
$799.60 each

$22,548.00
$563.70 each

No Bid

Mack Industries, Inc.
201 Columbia Rd.
Valley City, OH 44280

No Bid

No Bid

$32,280.00
$538.00 each

$39,950.00
$799.00 each

$23,720.00
$593.00 each

No Bid

Ohio Valley Contracting
10361 Giverny Blvd.
Cincinnati OH 45241

Precise Pile Driving, Inc.
1140 Fort Recovery-Minster Road
Fort Recovery, OH 45846

Prestress Services
250 N. Hartford Ave.
Ste 310

Columbus, OH 43222

$84,000.00
$12,000.00 each

$140,000.00
$20,000.00 each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

United Precast Industries LLC
400 Howard St.
Mt. Vernon, OH 43050
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