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QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page 3.2 - ADDENDUM #1 

* Attach applicable specifications/technical data 
# See additional detailed specifications provided 

Free Unloading Time 2 ½ HOURS 

Demurrage Rate ___________ _ 

NOTE: These blanks must be completed. 

Source of supply __________ _ 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
W\\'W.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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3) Hei-Way LLC
290 North Pike Road 
Sarver, PA 16055 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page 2 

PART A 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as F.O.B. and supplied in accordance with the 

ODOT 2023 Construction and Materials Specifications. Plant prices: 

UNIT 

Item 301 Bituminous Aggregate Base Ton 

Item 302 Bituminous Aggregate Base Ton 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Ton 

Course, Type 1 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Ton 

Course, Type 2 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Ton 

Surface Course, Type 1 

Asphalt Cold Mix* Ton 

*please attach JMF 

Coun ty Engineer 
Env ironmenta l Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
IVlarysville. Oh io 43040 

PRICE 

,JO 01D 

.," 

~ 141 

I' 937. 645. 302 1 
F 9:i?. 645.3161 
www.unioncotJ11tyohio.gov/c11ginccr 
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4) Asphalt Materials Inc
219 ½ West High Street 
Edison, OH 43320 

QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page 3.1 -ADDENDUM #1 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as delivered prices. Each quotation shall 

specify the source of supply. Only one QUOTATION will be considered from any single source of 

supply. Free unloading time and demurrage rates shall be included with each Quotation. 

PART B (Surface Treatment) 

DESCRIPTION POLYMER UNIT 

MC-30 N/A Gallon 

RS-2 N/A Gallon 

CM-90 N/A Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

CRS-2P {SBS) Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CSS-1 HD (50% diluted Fog Seal) Gallon 

Fast Drying Fog Seal 
*{FasBlack or equivalent) Gallon 

CM-150# N/A Gallon 

CM-300 N/A Gallon 

Engineered Recycling Emulsion, 
Cold Central Plant N/A Gallon 

Mixing Plant Mix Tons 

Mixing Plant Mobilization Lump 

Premium for "Supply Bond" Lump 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

UNIT PRICE 

4.30 

2.08 

3.15 

2.35 

No Bid 

No Bid 

2.189 

2.189 

2.189 

1.519 

1.519 

3.50 

3.55 

3.13 

3.50 

$1250.00 

0.0 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page 3.2 - ADDENDUM #1 

*Attach applicable specifications/technical data 
# See additional detailed specifications provided 

Free Unloading Time 2 ½ HOURS 

Demurrage Rate $150.00 per hour 

NOTE: These blanks must be completed. 

Source of supply Oregon, Edison, Columbus, Marietta and or Toledo 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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5) Terry Aspahlt Materials, Inc.
8600 Bilstein Blvd. 
Hamilton, OH 45015 

QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page 3.1 - ADDENDUM #1 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as delivered prices. Each quotation shall 

specify the source of supply. Only one QUOTATION will be considered from any single source of 

supply. Free unloading time and demurrage rates shall be included with each Quotation. 

PART B {Surface Treatment) 

DESCRIPTION POLYMER UNIT UNIT PRICE 

MC-30 N/A Gallon 

RS-2 N/A Gallon 

CM-90 N/A Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

RS-2P {SBS) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CSS-1 HD (50% diluted Fog Seal) Gallon 

Fast Drying Fog Seal 
*(FasBlack or equivalent) Gallon 

CM-150# N/A Gallon 

CM-300 N/A Gallon 

Engineered Recycling Emulsion , 
Cold Central Plant N/A Gallon 

Mixing Plant Mix Tons 

Mixing Plant Mobilization Lump 

Premium for "Supply Bond" Lump 

County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street 

Environmental Engineer Marysville. Ohio 43040 

No Bid 

2.27 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

2.60 

2.60 

2.60 

No Bid 

1.66 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page 3.2 - ADDENDUM #1 

*Attach applicable specifications/technical data 
# See additional detailed specifications provided 

Free Unloading Time 2 ½ HOURS 

Demurrage Rate 125.00 Per Hr. 

NOTE: These blanks must be completed. 

Source of supply Terry Asphalt Materials Inc. 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

P 93 7. 645. 3021 
F 937.645.3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/cngineer 
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6) The Klink Group
PO Box 428 
Ashley, Indiana 46705 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MA TE RIALS 
Page 3 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as delivered prices. Each quotation shall 

specify the source of supply. Only one QUOTATION will be considered from any single source of 

supply. Free unloading time and demurrage rates shall be included with each Quotation. 

PART B (Surface Treatment) 

DESCRIPTION POLYMER UNIT 

MC-30 NIA Gallon 

RS-2 N/A Gallon 

CM-90 NIA Gallon 

HFRS-2P (S8S) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CSS-1 HD (50% diluted Fog Seal) Gallon 

Fast Drying Fog Seal 
*(FasBlack or equivalent) Gallon 

Premium for "Supply Bond" LUMP 

*Attach applicable specifications/techn ical data 

Free Unloading Time 2 ½ HOURS 

Demurrage Rate ~135.00 L Hr 

NOTE: These blanks must be completed . 

Source of supply K-Tech Specialty Coatings 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Strc-cl 
Mar,s, ille. Ohio 43040 

UNIT PRICE 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

2.271 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

P 937, 6~5. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
"W\\. unhH1Ct1\.intyohio.gov/cngi111:cr 
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7) Shelly Materials
1700 Fostoria Ave 
Ste 200 
PO Box 3100 
Findlay, OH 45840 

QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page2 

PART A 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as F.O.B. and supplied in accordance with the 

ODOT 2023 Construction and Materials Specifications. Plant prices: 

UNIT PRICE 

Item 301 Bituminous Aggregate Base Ton $76.00 

Item 302 Bituminous Aggregate Base Ton $76.00 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Ton $88.00 

Course, Type 1 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Ton $78.00 

Course, Type 2 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Ton $88.00 

Surface Course, Type 1 

Asphalt Cold Mix* Ton No Bid 

*please attach JMF Belle Center (4080) 1558 CR 105 Belle Center, OH 43310 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

P 937. 645. 302 1 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page2 

PART A 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as F.O.B. and supplied in accordance with the 

ODOT 2023 Construction and Materials Specifications. Plant prices: 

UNIT PRICE 

Item 301 Bituminous Aggregate Base Ton $78.50 

Item 302 Bituminous Aggregate Base Ton $78.50 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Ton $91 .50 

Course, Type 1 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Ton $84.50 

Course, Type 2 

Item 441 Asphalt Concrete Ton $91.50 

Surface Course, Type 1 

Asphalt Cold Mix* Ton No Bid 

*please attach JMF Ostrander Plant #24 8328 Watkins Rd. , Ostrander, OH 43061 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

P 937. 645, 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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QUOTATION 
ASPHALT MATERIALS 
Page3 

The following ASPHALT MATERIALS shall be quoted as delivered prices. Each quotation shall 

specify the source of supply. Only one QUOTATION will be considered from any single source of 

supply. Free unloading time and demurrage rates shall be included with each Quotation. 

PART B (Surface Treatment> 

DESCRIPTION POLYMER UNIT 

MC-30 N/A Gallon 

RS-2 N/A Gallon 

CM-90 N/A Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBS) Gallon 

HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

RS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CRS-2P (SBR-latex) Gallon 

CSS-1 HD (50% diluted Fog Seal) Gallon 

Fast Drying Fog Seal 
*(FasBlack or equivalent) Gallon 

Premium for "Supply Bond" LUMP 

*Attach applicable specifications/technical data 

Free Unloading Time 2 ½ HOURS 

Demurrage Rate No Bid 

NOTE: These blanks must be completed . 

Source of supply No Bid 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

UNIT PRICE 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 



VOLUME 2025 PAGE 1498
UNION COUNTY COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL 2025 

April 9, 2025

Palmer Energy Update – Amy Hoffman:
 The current electric contract with Palmer ends in May. The next contract will start in May 2025 

and end in May 2027 at a fixed rate. 
 Commissioner McCarthy asked what the impact will be on utility costs and Ms. Hoffman stated 

the 25% rate increase will increase the costs.  
 
The following handouts accompanied Ms. Hoffman’s update: 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• 

• 

To: 

From: 

Energy Committee for CCAOSC Energy Program 

Palmer Energy 

March 26, 2025 

Subject: Electric Refresh RFP Results for CCAOSC Electric Supply Purchasing Group 

CCAO Service Corporation and Palmer Energy issued an RFP to obtain refresh electric pricing for 67 Program Participants' 
electric facilities. 

Recommendation Summary 

Group Term End Supplier Price Structure Rate Offer ($/kWh) 

1 May 2027 Dynegy All-inclusive $0.08046 

2 May 2027 CPV Energy Capacity pass-through $0.05767 + capacity costs 

3 May 2027 CPV Energy Capacity pass-through $0.05603 + capacity costs 

Please see Attachments Band C for additional recommendation details and a summmy ofrefi'esh pricing offers. 

The prices for all terms and suppliers proposed through this RFP are subject to federa l, transmission organization, statewide 
regulatory changes, and/or material changes of the accounts included resulting in additional costs to the supplier. This is a 
standard provision across virtually every supplier and contract 

RFP Overview 
This RFP encompasses over 4,000 accounts consuming approximately 6 15 million kWh annually . Accounts included in 
this RFP were allocated into three groups defined by usage. Program Participants may have accounts in more than one 
group. 

Group Account Group Program Contract Meter Read Est.# of Est. Annual 
Participants Start Dates Accounts Usage 

1 < 700,000 kWh/year 66 May 2025 I Dec 2025 / May 2026 3,838 192.9 GWh 

2 > 700,000 to < 4 million kWh/year 48 May 2025 I Dec 2025 I May 2026 169 254.5 GWh 

3 _:::_ 4 million kWh/year 10 May 2025 I Dec 2025 / May 2026 21 167.8 GWh 

TOTAL: 4,028 615.2 GWh 

For a summary of each Program Participant's accounts per group, please see Attachment A. 

• Refresh pricing was requested from the recommended suppliers as detailed in the RFP recommendation dated October 
9, 2024 and refreshed recommendation dated November 12, 2024. 

• Suppliers were asked to provide aggregate pricing for three groups, designated by load. 
• Two pricing structures were requested: all-inclusive and capacity pass-through pricing. 
• Three start dates were utilized based on current contract expirations with requested contract terms ending in May 2027 

and May 2028. 
• The five (5) recommended suppliers (AEP Energy, CPV Energy, Dynegy, Engie, and IGS Energy) provided refresh 

price offers for one or more groups. 
• The CCAO and Palmer worked with Ohio Prosecuting Attorneys Association and various County prosecutors to 

negotiate the terms and conditions. 

Energy Consulting Experts 
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$300.00 

$280.00 

$260.00 

$240.00 

$220.00 

$200.00 

$180.00 

>-m ; $160.00 

~ 
$140.00 

$120.00 

$100.00 

S80.00 

S60.00 

S40.00 

S20.00 $28.45 ___ 

·Chart does not include nol'fnO settlements 
25/26 represents Base Residual Auction rosutts 
All other time ericds reflect final auction results 

Historic PJM RTO Capacity Auction Results 

S270.35 

$164.70 

- $29.50 

Delivery Vear (June 1 - May 31) 

Energy Consulting Experts 
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To: 

From: 

Subject: 

Palmer Energy's Valued Clients 

Palmer Energy 

2025/2026 PJM Capacity Auction Results 

As you may have recently seen in the news, PJM, the Regional Transmission Organization (RTO) overseeing the 
electric grid in Ohio and many surrounding states, announced the generation capacity auction results for the 
delivery year beginning June I, 2025. The announcement garnered wide attention due to a price jump from the 
current rate of$29.50/MW-day for most Ohioans, to a rate of$270.35/MW-day. The information below provides 
a review of capacity, how these costs are calculated, what the recent announcement means for Ohio and your 
organization, and important considerations for future planning. 

What is capacity? 
PJM is responsible for ensuring that there is enough electricity available to meet the demand on any section 
of the grid at any time. 

This is accomplished by compensating generating plants and consumers that can reliably reduce their load on 
the system for sufficient supply to meet forecasted system demands. 

The amount of the payments is established through a series of auctions. 

Historically, auctions were held three years in advance, but the timeline has been delayed in recent years due 
to market reforms. 
⇒ This recent auction will impact consumers' bills starting June 1, 2025. 

As the auction value (RPM rate) fluctuates, it serves as a price signal to generation developers indicating the 
need for investment in additional generation assets. 

How are capacity costs determined for a customer? 
Capacity costs vary by individual account and are primarily driven by a customer's Peak Load Contribution 
or PLC. 

A customer's PLC represents their share of the peak demand on PJM's system. 

PLCs are based on the estimated or measured load of that end user during the five peak demand hours on the 
system from the prior summer. 

- For example, current PLCs (June I, 2024 - May 31, 2025) were established during the summer of 2023. 

- Peak hours can occur on any weekday that is not a federal holiday between June 1 and September 30, and 
typically occur between the hours of 2-6 PM during extremely hot weather. 

Why are capacity rates increasing so much? The simple explanation for the coming increase in capacity costs 
is due to supply and demand. 

US electric demand is seeing higher growth from large data centers, electric vehicles, hotter weather, and 
organizations enacting environmentally conscious goals and policies. 

Supply has been affected by generation retirements over the past few years and the longer and costlier timeline 
to construct new units. 

Energy Consulting Experts 
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fAJv·l't't~O 
- PJM has also been working with the Federal Regulatory Energy Commission (FERC) on refmming the 

capacity market to handle the evolving energy landscape. 
⇒ Much of the new generation being planned or built is in the form of renewables. 
⇒ PJM is reassessing how to fairly value these assets and their reliability both during peak periods and 

ongoing operational requirements. 

What does this mean for me? Unfortunately, this increase is unavoidable for all Ohio customers behind 
investor-owned utilities (AEP, AES. FirstEnergy. and Duke). Ohio consumers will pay their portion of these 
costs regardless of whether they are supplied directly through their utility or shopping for third-party power 
supplies. 

- For those utilizing a capacity pass-through contract structure, there is no change in how this is billed, nor will 
it impact the contract rate. The impact of the capacity cost increase will begin June l, 2025, and will be based 
on the PLC for that delive1y year. 

- For those utilizing a fixed, all-inclusive price structure, most suppliers will pass the cost increase through as 
a separate charge in addition to the contract rate. This is allowed under the regulatory change clause included 
in almost all energy contracts. 

- Palmer will review any pass-through costs to the ensure accuracy of the cost impact. 

- As infonnation becomes available, Palmer will update its customers with planning for this cost increase. 

Cost Example - For Comparison Purposes Only 
Customer A has a contract rate of $0.060/kWh, not including capacity costs. 

- Assuming the same contract rate and a PLC remaining at 150 kW (0.15 MW), Customer A uses 100,000 kWh 
in October 2024 (31 days) and again in July 2025 (31 days). 

October 2024 would be calculated at the cmrnnt RPM rate and July 2025 at the increased RPM rate. 

Cost Catel!orv Calculation Result 
Energy costs = 100,000 kWh x $0.060/kWh $6,000 

October Capacity costs = 0.15 MW x $29.50/MW-day x Scaling Factors x 31 days q65 
2024 Total Gen costs = $6 165 

Average Unit cost = $0.062/kWh 

Energy costs = 100,000 kWh x $0.060/kWh $6,000 
July Caoacitv costs = 0.15 MW x $270.35/MW-dav x Scaling Factors x 31 davs $1 510 
2025 Total Gen costs = $7 510 

Average Unit cost= $0.075/kWh 

Can capacity costs be managed? 
- Yes, but the short timeline and the PLC determination occurring during this summer's peak hours means there 

is little that can be done to manage capacity costs for the delive1y year beginning June 1, 2025 . 

However, future capacity costs can be reduced by various measures such as behind-the-meter solar, peak 
shaving, demand-side management, energy efficiency investments, and participating in a demand response 
program. 

- Palmer can assist in the development and implementation of any of these projects and/or provide an evaluation 
of project proposals received from outside entities. 

Energy Consulting Experts 
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 Ms. Hoffman stated getting information about electric aggregation to the public is the key to getting 
it passed on the ballot.  

 Commissioner McCarthy stated the public does not understand how they benefit from this passing.  
 Commissioner Robinson stated any unincorporated resident that does not have URE could benefit 

from aggregation. They will get a lower rate on their electric bill.  
 Ms. Hoffman stated any resident or small business could benefit from this.  
 Commissioner McCarthy asked how much a resident could potentially save from this, and Ms. 

Hoffman stated the average is between $100 to $150 a year off the price of the utility. 
 Ms. Hoffman stated residents are not bound to the aggregation contract, and they can opt out at any 

time without any consequences.  
 Commissioner Robinson asked what the deadline was for filing to get this on the ballot again, and 

Mr. Gray stated it is August 6.  
 Ms. Hoffman stated if the Commissioners wanted to put this on the ballot again, there should be 

public meetings to get correct information out to the public.  

* * * 
 

* County Administrator William Narducci provided the following updates: 
 Yesterday he was on a call with Ohio University’s Economic Development to discuss the impacts 

of companies getting incentives to come into communities. They talked in depth about how to fund 
and conduct this type of analysis. There are other communities wanting to see this type of analysis 
as well. 

 He will be attending the Safety Council Dinner with Ginger Yonak tonight at Der Dutchman.  
 

* * * 
 

*Assistant County Prosecutor Thayne Gray provided the following updates: 
 No report. 

 
* * *  

 
*Commissioner David A. Lawrence provided the following updates: 

 He attended the Land Bank meeting, and they decided to appraise the old Minute Lube property on 
Main Street and offer it to the city.  

 He attended the CIC Board meeting.  
 He attended the tour of Nestle plant. 

 
* * *  

 
Commissioner Tom McCarthy provided the following updates: 

 He attended the Land Bank meeting with Commissioner Lawrence. 
 He attended the Airport Authority meeting. He encouraged them to submit their t-hanger funding 

plans to Thayne for review and approval.  
 

* * *  
 
Commissioner Steve Robinson provided the following updates: 

 He attended the Nestle tour with Commissioner Lawrence. 

• 

• 
• 

• 
• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 

• 
• 

• 
• 

• 
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 Last Friday, there were two interviews for potential Memorial Hospital Board members. There are 
two more next Thursday. After those are done, two of the individuals will be interviewed by the 
Board and Judge Fraser and Judge Rodger.  

 After the interviews, he attended the CEBCO Board Meeting.  
 He will not be attending the LUC meeting tomorrow. Mr. Narducci will go in his place.   

 
* * *  

 
*Commissioner Steve Robinson adjourned the meeting at 10:25 a.m.  

The preceding Minutes were read and approved April 23, 2025. 
 
 

 __________________________ 
 Steve Robinson 
 Commissioner 
 
 
 
 
 __________________________ 
 David A. Lawrence 
 Commissioner 
 
 
 
 
 __________________________ 
 Tom McCarthy 
 Commissioner 
 
 
 
 
________________________________ 
Mallory Lehman, Clerk to the Board 
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• 
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