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April 2, 2025

Bid Opening – 2025 Aggregate and Concrete Materials for 2025 – Engineer  

The following Bids were received at 9:30 a.m. and opened and real aloud immediately thereafter. 

1) Buckeye Ready-Mix 
838 N. Main St.  
Marysville, OH 43040 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Notes: _ _ __________ _________ ______________ _ 

QC1 CONCRETE 

$ I qa. 't.. S per cubic yard 

QC2 CONCRETE 

$ t 9 Y , .$' O per cubic yard 

GDF FLOW MIX 

$ IL.//. CO per cub ic yard 

IF YOU HAVE A MINIMUM CUBIC YARDAGE REQUIREMENT WHEN ORDERING, PLEASE INDICATE 

BELOW IN THE SECTION FOR "NOTES". 

Notes: ;. 'l'A~t::) ,-.,,,,J1f-HJr-< , SG.E. ATTAc 1..)e i-:::. p~1c_E. sJ..JeE., 

Name, address , signature , and phone number of the person , firm or corporation submitting this Quotation: 

Company Name {6uctt.~'-<E, /Z..e.A"l::.Y· Hn<. , LLC . 

Address ~3°8' N , HA1t..J ~ .,-. Plant J 1 - HAR.-,J ,:s~ 1 L <. E 

Phone Number (to / '-I · )... O '- - '- '-I Z.. 9 Fax Number _________ _ _ 

Signature -z' m · tA:P_jJ Date 3 f o / ""{,~ 

Name J.!. G. '\J I IV ),} I '- L.. Title S A (.. €: .s /Z.. € '1!> • 

E-mail address /-l 1J ILl..@.,. •J!,LJc.K- €'le ~eA-~Y/'11 '>I! . COM 

Complete and return a copy of this Quotation. 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 

Marysville, Ohio 43040 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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2) National Lime & Stone Company 
551 Lake Cascades Parkway 
PO Box 120 
Findlay, OH 45839 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

QUOTATION 

The Board of Commissioners of Union County, Ohio, will accept sealed unit price Quotations in the office of the 

Board of Commissioners, County Office Building, 233 W. 6th Street, Marysville, Ohio 43040 until 9:30 AM on 

Wednesday, April 2, 2025, for the purchase of AGGREGATE MATERIALS and CONCRETE MATERIALS. 

The Quotations will be opened and read aloud immediately thereafter on the same date and at the same 

location. 

1. AGGREGATE MATERIALS and/orQC1 and/orQC2 CONCRETE and/orCDF 

FLOW MIX shall conform to the 2023 edition of the Construction and Material 

Specifications of the Ohio Department of Transportation. 

2. The unit prices quoted shall remain in effect through December 31, 2024. 

3. AGGREGATE MATERIALS shall be priced per ton and shall be F.O.B. plant. 

4. QC1 and QC2 CONCRETE and CDF FLOW MIX shall be priced per cubic yard 

and shall include delivery. Please submit ODOT approved mix designs for 

both QC1 and QC2 concrete for 2024 with your quotation. These mixes will 

be required for all concrete ordered in 2024 unless otherwise specified by 

the Union County Engineer. 

5. Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) provided must be crushed material. 

6. Selection of vendor will be based on the length of haul and the availability of 

materials. Payment for materials will be based upon the vendor's monthly 

statement. 

7 . The Board of Commissioners of Union County reserves the right to reject any or 

all quotations and to waive any irregularities or informalities in any quotation. 

AGGREGATE 

#1 stone $\J~ per ton Item 304 $ 1..). C)() per ton 

#2 $ 'Ll.1).~0 

#4 $ Tu . lJ () 

Type A Rip Rap $ L\\J . ()() 

Type B Rip Rap r j ~. Q 
Type C Rip Rap $L)\.) l,)!,J 

Type D Rip Rap $'-\~. G\':l 

#57 $30.LS" 

#8 $'3S°'. )0 

#9 $1..\.o.OQ 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

per ton Item 310 $ ),j I\ per ton 

per ton Item 411 $ L ~ O() per ton 

per ton 703.1 O Screenings $1-1.... .l")" per ton 

per ton Sand 

per ton 

per ton 

Mason Sand 

Filter Sand 

Dirt per ton 

per ton 

per ton 

RAP 

233 W. Sixth Streel 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

$L.).0() per ton 

$ NI\ per ton 

$ N .t\ per ton 

$ N '?t per ton 

$ hl f\ per ton 

$ per ton 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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3) Duff Quarry, Inc. 
9042 State Route 117 
PO Box 305 
Huntsville, OH 43324 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

QUOTATION 

The Board of Commissioners of Union County, Ohio, will accept sealed unit price Quotations in the office of the 

Board of Commissioners, County Office Building, 233 W. 6th Street, Marysville, Ohio 43040 until 9:30 AM on 

Wednesday, April 2, 2025, for the purchase of AGGREGATE MATERIALS and CONCRETE MATERIALS. 

The Quotations will be opened and read aloud immediately thereafter on the same date and at the same 

location. 

1. AGGREGATE MATERIALS and/or QC1 and/or QC2 CONCRETE and/or GDF 

FLOW MIX shall conform to the 2023 edition of the Construction and Material 
Specifications of the Ohio Department of Transportation . 

2. The unit prices quoted shall remain in effect through December 31, 2024. 

3. AGGREGATE MATERIALS shall be priced per ton and shall be F.O.B. plant. 

4. QC1 and QC2 CONCRETE and CDF FLOW MIX shall be priced per cubic yard 

and shall include delivery. Please submit ODOT approved mix designs for 
both QC1 and QC2 concrete for 2024 with your quotation. These mixes will 
be required for all concrete ordered in 2024 unless otherwise specified by 

the Union County Engineer. 

5. Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) provided must be crushed material. 

6. Selection of vendor will be based on the length of haul and the availability of 

materials. Payment for materials will be based upon the vendor's monthly 

statement. 

7. The Board of Commissioners of Union County reserves the right to reject any or 

all quotations and to waive any irregularities or informalities in any quotation. 

AGGREGATE 

#1 stone $ per ton Item 304 $ 17.50 per ton 

#2 $ 18.25 per ton Item 310 $ 17.50 per ton 

#4 $ 18.25 per ton Item 411 $ 17.50 per ton 

Type A Rip Rap $ 30.75 per ton 703.1 O Screenings $ 17.50 per ton 

Type B Rip Rap $ 30.75 per ton Sand $ 24.75 per ton 

Type C Rip Rap $ 30.75 per ton Mason Sand $ 41.00 per ton 

Type D Rip Rap $ 30.75 per ton Filter Sand $ per ton 

#57 $ 19.00 per ton Dirt $ per ton 

#8 $ 26.00 per ton RAP $ per ton 

#9 $ 17.50 per ton $ per ton 

County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street P 937. 645. 3021 

Environmental Engineer Marysvi ll e, Ohio 43040 F 937. 645. 3 161 
www.unioncountyohio.govicngincer 
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4) Ohio Ready Mix, Inc. 
9016 State Route 117 N  
PO Box 305 
Huntsville, OH 43324 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Notes: __________ __________________________ _ 

QC1 CONCRETE 

$ ___ 18_4_.5_0 __ per cubic yard 

QC2 CONCRETE 

$ 188.50 per cubic yard 

CDF FLOW MIX 

$ 136.50 per cubic yard 

IF YOU HAVE A MINIMUM CUBIC YARDAGE REQUIREMENT WHEN ORDERING, PLEASE INDICATE 
BELOW IN THE SECTION FOR "NOTES". 

Notes: ______________________________ _ 

Name, address, signature, and phone number of the person, firm or corporation submitting this Quotation: 

Company Name Ohio Ready Mix Inc. 

Address 9016 State Route 117 

Huntsville, Ohio 43324 

Plant Huntsville 

Phone Number 937-686-4313 

Signature -<'4e9 ~+ 
Name Riley Huffer 

Fax Number 937-686-5125 

Date 3/25/25 

E-mail address rileyhuffer@ohioreadymix.com 

Complete and return a copy of this Quotation. 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

Title Business Development & Sales 

P 937. 645. 3021 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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5) Shelly Materials, Inc. 
1700 Fostoria Ave.
Ste. 200 
PO Box 3100 
Findlay, OH 45840 

QUOTATION 

The Board of Commissioners of Union County, Ohio, will accept sealed unit price Quotations in the office of the 
Board of Commissioners, County Office Building, 233 W. 6th Street, Marysville, Ohio 43040 until 9:30 AM on 
Wednesday, April 2, 2025, for the purchase of AGGREGATE MATERIALS and CONCRETE MATERIALS. 
The Quotations will be opened and read aloud immediately thereafter on the same date and at the same 
location. 

1. AGGREGATE MATERIALS and/or QC1 and/or QC2 CONCRETE and/or CDF 
FLOW MIX shall conform to the 2023 edition of the Construction and Material 
Specifications of the Ohio Department of Transportation. 

2. The unit prices quoted shall remain in effect through December 31 , 2024. 

3. AGGREGATE MATERIALS shall be priced per ton and shall be F.O.B. plant. 

4. QC1 and QC2 CONCRETE and CDF FLOW MIX shall be priced per cubic yard 
and shall include delivery. Please submit ODOT approved mix designs for 
both QC1 and QC2 concrete for 2024 with your quotation. These mixes will 
be required for all concrete ordered in 2024 unless otherwise specified by 
the Union County Engineer. 

5. Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) provided must be crushed material. 

6. Selection of vendor will be based on the length of haul and the availability of 
materials. Payment for materials will be based upon the vendor's monthly 
statement. 

7. The Board of Commissioners of Union County reserves the right to reject any or 
all quotations and to waive any irregularities or informalities in any quotation. 

AGGREGATE 

#1 stone $ No Bid perton Item 304 $ No Bid per ton 

#2 $ No Bid per ton Item 310 $ No Bid per ton 

#4 $ No Bid per ton Item 411 $ No Bid per ton 

Type A Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton 703.10 Screenings $ No Bid per ton 

Type B Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton Sand $ ~12Bid per ton 

Type C Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton Mason Sand $ No Bid per ton 

Type D Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton Filter Sand $ No Bid per ton 

#57 $ No Bid per ton Dirt $ No Bid per ton 

#8 $ No Bid per ton RAP $ No Bid per ton 

#9 $ 14.10 per ton $ No Bid per ton 

Location -Belle Center 1558 County Rd. 105, Belle Center, OH 43310 

County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street P 937. 645. 3021 
Environmental Engineer Marysville, Ohio 43040 F 937. 645. 3161 

www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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QUOTATION 

The Board of Commissioners of Union County, Ohio, will accept sealed unit price Quotations in the office of the 
Board of Commissioners, County Office Building, 233 W. 6th Street, Marysville, Ohio 43040 until 9:30 AM on 
Wednesday, April 2, 2025, for the purchase of AGGREGATE MATERIALS and CONCRETE MATERIALS. 
The Quotations will be opened and read aloud immediately thereafter on the same date and at the same 
location. 

1. AGGREGATE MATERIALS and/or QC 1 and/or QC2 CONCRETE and/or CDF 
FLOW MIX shall conform to the 2023 edition of the Construction and Material 
Specifications of the Ohio Department of Transportation. 

2. The unit prices quoted shall remain in effect through December 31, 2024. 

3. AGGREGATE MATERIALS shall be priced per ton and shall be F.O.B. plant. 

4. QC1 and QC2 CONCRETE and CDF FLOW MIX shall be priced per cubic yard 
and shall include delivery. Please submit ODOT approved mix designs for 
both QC1 and QC2 concrete for 2024 with your quotation. These mixes will 
be required for all concrete ordered in 2024 unless otherwise specified by 
the Union County Engineer. 

5. Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) provided must be crushed material. 

6. Selection of vendor will be based on the length of haul and the availability of 
materials. Payment for materials will be based upon the vendor's monthly 
statement. 

7. The Board of Commissioners of Union County reserves the right to reject any or 
all quotations and to waive any irregularities or informalities in any quotation. 

AGGREGATE 

#1 stone $ ~2E!id per ton Item 304 $ 16.00 per ton 

#2 $ 17.50 per ton Item 310 $ 12.25 per ton 

#4 $ 19.50 perton Item 411 $ l6 QQ per ton 

Type A Rip Rap $ 45 00 per ton 703.10 Screenings $ No Bid per ton 

Type B Rip Rap $ 45.00 per ton Sand $ 15.00 per ton 

Type C Rip Rap $ 45.00 per ton Mason Sand $ No Bid per ton 

Type D Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton Filter Sand $ No Bid per ton 

#57 $ 25.25 per ton Dirt $ No Bid per ton 

#8 $ 34,0Q per ton RAP $ No Bid per ton 

#9 $ 15.75 per ton $ No Bid per ton 

Location - Ostrander Plant 8328 Watkins Rd., Ostrander, OH 43061 

County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street P 937. 645. 302 1 
Environmental Engineer Marysville, Ohio 43040 F 937. 645. 3161 

www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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QUOTATION 

The Board of Commissioners of Union County, Ohio, will accept sealed unit price Quotations in the office of the 
Board of Commissioners, County Office Building, 233 W. 6th Street, Marysville, Ohio 43040 until 9:30 AM on 
Wednesday, April 2, 2025, for the purchase of AGGREGATE MATERIALS and CONCRETE MATERIALS. 
The Quotations will be opened and read aloud immediately thereafter on the same date and at the same 
location. 

1. AGGREGATE MATERIALS and/or QC1 and/or QC2 CONCRETE and/or GDF 
FLOW MIX shall conform to the 2023 edition of the Construction and Material 
Specifications of the Ohio Department of Transportation. 

2. The unit prices quoted shall remain in effect through December 31, 2024. 

3. AGGREGATE MATERIALS shall be priced per ton and shall be F.O.B. plant. 

4. QC1 and QC2 CONCRETE and CDF FLOW MIX shall be priced per cubic yard 
and shall include delivery. Please submit ODOT approved mix designs for 
both QC1 and QC2 concrete for 2024 with your quotation. These mixes will 
be required for all concrete ordered in 2024 unless otherwise specified by 
the Union County Engineer. 

5. Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) provided must be crushed material. 

6. Selection of vendor will be based on the length of haul and the availability of 
materials. Payment for materials will be based upon the vendor's monthly 
statement. 

7. The Board of Commissioners of Union County reserves the right to reject any or 
all quotations and to waive any irregularities or informalities in any quotation. 

AGGREGATE 

#1 stone $ No Bid per ton Item 304 $ 13.60 per ton 

#2 $ 16 QQ per ton Item 310 $ 13.60 per ton 

#4 $ 16.00 per ton Item 411 $ 13.60 per ton 

Type A Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton 703.10 Screenings $ 12.25 per ton 

Type B Rip Rap $ No Bid per ton Sand $ ~a Bid per ton 

Type C Rip Rap $ 45.00 per ton Mason Sand $ No Bid per ton 

Type D Rip Rap $ 45.00 per ton Filter Sand $ No Bid per ton 

#57 $ 18.80 per ton Dirt $ No Bid per ton 

#8 $ 20.35 per ton RAP $ ~QBjd per ton 

#9 $ 14.10 per ton $ per ton 

Location - York Center 28855 SR 739, West Mansfield, OH 43358 

County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street P 937. 645. 302 1 
Environmental Engineer Marysville, Ohio 43040 F 937. 645. 3161 

www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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Notes: ____ ________________________ _ _ ______ _ 

QC1 CONCRETE 

$_~N=o~B=id~_ per cubic yard 

QC2 CONCRETE 

$ __ N_o_ B_id __ per cubic yard 

CDF FLOW MIX 

$ __ N_o_B_id ___ per cubic yard 

IF YOU HAVE A MINIMUM CUBIC YARDAGE REQUIREMENT WHEN ORDERING, PLEASE INDICATE 
BELOW IN THE SECTION FOR "NOTES". 

Notes: ______________________________ _ 

Name, address, signature, and phone number of the person, firm or corporation submitting this Quotation: 

Company Name Shelly Materials, Inc. 

Address1700 Fostoria Ave. Ste. 200. PO Box 3100 Plant Belle Center. York Center. Ostrander 

Findlay. OH 45840 

P~one Nu!r :!22-8854 Fax Number 419-429-3444 

S1gnature._._1]....,,..Q_~'-=-+--------------- Date_3_/3_1_/2_0_2_5 ____ __ _ 

Name Nathan Mathew 

E-mail address Thomas.Bell@shellyco.com 

Complete and return a copy of this Quotation. 

County Engineer 
Environmental Engineer 

233 W. Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

Title VP of Sales 

P 937. 645. 302 1 
F 937. 645. 3161 
www.unioncountyohio.gov/engineer 
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*Received the following from the Ohio Department of Agriculture approving the appointment of Josh 
Combs as the Deputy Apiarist for Union County for 2025: 

*Received the  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Department of 
Agriculture 
Pbn.tHr;alth 

UNION CO COMMISSION ERS 

233 W SIXTH STREET 

MARYSVILLE, OH 43040 

Agri.Ohio.gov 

Jim. Tressel. lt. Governo.f Brian Baldridge. Din!'<for 

March 18, 2025 

Dear Union County Commissioners, 

Thank you for supporting the Ohio Department of Agriculture's Apiary Program and 
Ohio's beekeeping industry by appointing a Deputy Apiarist to serve in Union County. 

We are pleased to consent to the appointment of Josh Combs as the Deputy 
Apiarist for Union County for the year 2025. As agreed, the compensation and mailing 
information for the Deputy Apiarist is documented below. 

Josh Combs 
235 W. Center 
Milford Center, OH 43045 

Appropriation: $3,500.00 
Salary: N/A 
Mileage: N/A 

Ohio's Apiary Program is a cooperative effort that depends on both state and county 
inspection services to help to ensure a healthy beekeeping industry for Ohio's more 
than 6,000 apiaries. Thank you again for your support of Ohio Agriculture. 

Sincerely, 

~~~ 
Ohio Department of Agri culture 

Serving Farmers and Protecting Consumers Since 1846 
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*Received Don’s Viers resignation from the Union County Joint Recreation Board: 

 

* * *  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

March 17, 2025 

From: Don Viers 
16790 Mackan Rd. 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

To: Union County, Commissioners 
233 West Sixth Street 
Marysville, Ohio 43040 

After serving on the UNION COUNTY JOINT RECREATION DISTRICT 
BOARD for 22 years, I hereby resign my position, for personal 
reasons. 
I nominate Jennifer Segner Maxwell, of 16770 Mackan Road, 
Marysville, Ohio 43040, as my replacement. 

Don Viers 

03/17/25 
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*Received the appointment of Scott Anspaugh to the Union County Board of Developmental Disabilities 
from the Union County Common Pleas Court: 
 

 

* * *  

IN THE COURT OF COMMON PLEAS, UNION COUNTY, OHIO 
PROBATE DIVISION 

IN THE MATIER OF: 

The Union County Board 
Of Developmental Disabilities 

Case No.: :::0 ~ C 
202fil3Jo~ ~~ u 

;a;; ::z: ,::::,;;,; 
-:,:· > . .. r""'I 

g_ ~ t2r;; .. :, 
~ en _:~ :.n =· - ~,:, 

JOURNAL ENTRY: ~ :-<cio 
APPOINTMENf ~ M~ c::: ·-i 

~"') ~ 0 
Whereas, the General Assembly of the State of Ohio has passed Ohi o Revised Code 

Section 5126.02, concerning the creation of the County Board of Developmental Disabilities 

and O.R.C. Sections 5126.021-5126.029, concerning the appointment of its members, the 

Court finds that the Probate Judge has the authority to appoint members to the Union 

County Board of Developmental Disabilities with each member to serve a four-year term 

and; 

Whereas, one of the Probate Judge's appointees must be "an immediate family 

member of an individual eligible for residential services or supported living." 

Now, therefore, IT IS THE ORDER of the Court that Scott Anspaugh is hereby 

appointed to serve the full term beginning January 1, 2025 and ending December 31, 2028. 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a copy of this Order be mailed by the Clerk of 

this Court to Scott Anspaugh, the Appointee; President of the Union County Board of 

Developmental Disabilities; Kara L. Brown, Superintendent of the Union County Board of 

Developmental Disabilities; and the Union County Board of Commissioners. 

IT IS SO ORDERED. 

Copy: Scott Anspaugh, Appointee 
President of UCBDD 

;;;;&: 
Kara L. Brown, Superintendent of UCBDD 
Union County Board of Commissioners 
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*Received the County Share of Public Assistance Expenditures Mandated Share for State Fiscal Year 
2025 from the Ohio Department of Job & Family Services: 

 

* * *  
 
 
 
 

JFS.Ohio.gov ~ Departme,:at of 
VFU¥ Job & Family 
C-;r Services 

Mike DeWine, Governor Jim Tressel, Lt. Governor Matt Damschroder, Director 

March 21, 2025 

TO: 

FROM: 

SUBJECT: 

Union County 
Board of County Commissioners 9/ 
Jeffrey Newman, Chief Fiscal Officer 
Office of Fiscal and Monitoring Services 

COUNTY SHARE OF PUBLIC ASSISTANCE EXPENDITURES 
MANDATED SHARE FOR ST ATE FISCAL YEAR 2026 

In accordance with the methodology established in ORC 5101.16 and OAC 5101 :9-6-31, the initial 
calculation of your county share of reimbursable T ANF and Income Maintenance expenditures for State 
Fiscal Year (SFY) 2026 is $78,324 . 

Mandated Share for non-T ANF is based on SFY 2024 actual expenditures for Medicaid administration, 
Food Assistance administration and any Disability Financial Assistance administration collections. 
Mandated Share for TANF is based on Federal Fiscal Year 1994 actual county share for assistance, 
administration, and services provided under Titles IV-A and IV-F, adjusted to seventy-five percent 
(75%). 

Description 

T ANF cash benefits & 
administration 

Food Assistance 

Medicaid Administration 

Disability Assistance 

Total SFY 2026 
Mandated Share 

Actual 
Expenditures 

$239,003 

$222,319 

$0 

Calculated 
Mandated 

Share 

$37,1 43 

$23,900 

$22,232 

$0 

$83,275 

Calculated 
105% Adj Mandated Share 

Less 105% Adj 

$37,143 

$(2,565) $21,335 

$(2 ,386) $19,846 

$0 $0 

$(4,951) $78,324 

The above certification does not include the county share of Child Support, Children Services, or local 
match rates for Social Services. In addition, non-reimbursable expenditures (ceiling excesses, audit 
exceptions, etc.) the county incurs are also county obligations. Please contact CFIS Help Desk@ 
CFIS Help Desk@jfs.ohio.gov or call (614) 752-9194 if you have any questions. 

c: County Job and Family Service Directors 
County Auditors 
ODJFS Fiscal Supervisors 

30 E. Broad Street 
Columbus, Ohio 43215 U.SA 

614 I 466 6282 
jfs.ohio.gov 

TIit Stat. of Ohio ls1n Equal OpportunltyEmpioyff and Pn>Ylderof MA Servlas 
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*Received the Notice of Frontier North Inc. (“Frontier”) of Termination of Video Service.  

 

* * *  
*Commissioner Steve Robinson adjourned the meeting at 9:46 a.m.  

The preceding Minutes were read and approved April 16, 2025. 
 
 

u 
FRONTIER 

March 27, 2025 

County Commissioners 
Union County 
233 W Sixth St 
Marysville, OH 43040 

Dear County Commissioners, 

Kevin Saville 
Senior Vice President, General Counsel 

1005 West Cove Lane, Mound, MN 55364 
Frontier.com 

Re: Notice of Frontier North Inc. ("Frontier") of Termination of Video Service 

This will serve as notice under Ohio Rev. Code Ann . § 1332.27(C)(1) by Frontier of termination of 
video service to its entire video service area in Ohio. Termination will be effective July 1, 2025, which is 90 
days after notice given to the director, affected subscribers and the respective municipal corporations or 
townships comprising Frontier's video service area. Frontier currently has four total video subscribers in 
the State of Ohio. 

Sincerely, 

By ~~ 
f e~ Saville 
SVP, General Counsel 

ks 
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 __________________________ 
 Steve Robinson 
 Commissioner 
 
 
 
 
 __________________________ 
 David A. Lawrence 
 Commissioner 
 
 
 
 
 __________________________ 
 Tom McCarthy 
 Commissioner 
 
 
 
 
________________________________ 
Mallory Lehman, Clerk to the Board 
 
 

Digitally signed by Mallory Lehman 
DN: cn=Mallory Lehman, o=Commlssioners, 
ou=AssistantClerktotheBoard, 
email=mlehman@unioncountyohio.gov, c=US 
Date: 2025.04.16 10:30.53 -04'00' 
Adobe Acrobat version: 2020.005.30763 

Digitall)'$ignedbySteveRobinson 
DN:cn=SteveRobinson, 

~ /) /[] / , o=Commissioners,ou=Comminione,, 
lf,,/{//cYU,,--- email=mlehmc1n@unioorountyohio.gov, 
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Dilte:2025.04.1610:27:47 -04'00' 
AdobeAcrobatversion:2020.005.30763 

Digitall)'$ignedbyDi1VidA.LilWfenc;e 
ON: cn=D;wid A. Lawrence, 

J:} o=Commissioners, ou=Comminione,, 

~ {j er~ ~~tmlehmc1n@unioorountyohio.gov, 

Dilte:2025.04.1610:29:00-04'00' 
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Digitally signed by 
Tom McCarthy 
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