
 2020 Union County Aggregate Materials Quotation Tabulation

Shelly Materials

York Center Quarry

28855 SR 739

West Mansfield, OH   43358

937-464-3833

Nate Mathew

Shelly Materials

Ostrander Quarry

8328 Watkins Rd.

Ostrander, OH 43061

614-437-2311

Jay Garrison

The Apple Smith 

Corporation

3040 McKinley Ave.

Columbus, OH 43204

(614) 488-7950

Shelly Materials

Belle Center Quarry

1558  CR 105

Belle Center, OH 43310

937-464-3833

Nate Mathew

Duff Quarry, Inc.

Plant: 9042 St Rt 117

Huntsville, OH  43324

937-686-2811

J. Scott Duff

National Lime & Stone 

Plant: 2406 S. Section Line 

Delaware, OH  43015

740-369-7651

Scott Flores

Olen Corporation

4755 S. High St.

Columbus, Ohio 43207

(614) 491-1515

Buckeye Ready- Mix LLC

Plant: 838 N. Main St. 

Marysville, OH  43040

614-206-6433

Vern Flowers

Ohio Ready-Mix, Inc.

Plant:  24515 Honda Pkwy

Marysville, OH  43040

937-686-4313

J. Scott Duff

Greensboro Corporation

3040 McKinley Ave.

Columbus, OH 43204

(614) 488-7958

#1 No bid No bid No bid No bid

#2 $12.00 $13.35 $11.50 $18.90

#4 $12.00 $14.10 $11.50 $18.90

Type A Rip Rap $25.00 $28.00 $23.50 $27.50

Type B Rip Rap               $25.00 $28.00 $23.50 $27.50

Type C Rip Rap $25.00 $28.00 $23.50 $27.50

Type D Rip Rap $25.00 $28.00 $23.50 $27.50

#57 $13.50 $17.55 $11.75 $21.40

#8 $14.50 $21.90 $15.75 $14.25 $25.75

#9 $13.00 $9.45 $12.00 $11.25 No bid

Item 304 $10.25 $11.35 $10.50 $17.90

Item 310 $10.25 $10.50 No bid

Item 411 $10.25 $11.35 $10.50 $17.90

703.10 Screenings $9.50 $8.70 $11.25 $16.90

SAND No bid $9.50 $15.50 $21.00

MASON SAND $32.00 $34.00 $32.50 No bid

FILTER SAND

DIRT

#89 $21.00

RAP

304 Recycled concrete

617

QC1 CONCRETE $127.50

QC2 CONCRETE $131.50

CDF FLOW MIX $89.00

Surge Rock

Delivery Fees

Loads under 5 cubic yards

will incur $125 delivery fee


