County Engineer
Environmental Engineer
Building Department

233 W. Sixth Street

Marysville Operations Facility
16400 County Home Road
Marysville, Ohio 43040

P 937. 645. 3017

F 937.645. 3111

Marysville, Ohio 43040

P 937.645. 3018
F 937.645. 3161

WWW.C0.union.oh.us/engineer

Richwood Outpost
190 Beatty Avenue
Richwood. Ohio 43344

MEMO
TO: Board of Commissioners
FROM: Jeff Stauch

DATE: April 17, 2019

SUBJECT: 2019 Union County Precast Bids Received April 9, 2019.

Public Service with integrity

We have reviewed the referenced bids. The above referenced bid tabulation is listed below.

Proposal Proposal
Proposal Proposal Proposal Amount for AmoEnt for Proposal
P Amount for P CR 113H- Amount for
Amount for TR 267B- Amount for 5 469 CR 129K- CR 252A-
TR 267B- 0.965 CR 33B-1.966 o 8.135
: White Stone . 0.832
0.965 Schofield Taylor Road Claibourne
Schofield (48 linear feet paas Road SOLLEET
Company Name Road - (54 linear ) (56 linear feet
Road (7 beams — minimum of (60 linear feet L
s . feet - minimum of
(7 beams - | B12-48 x 31’ 14'x 4, 4 _ minimum of R
, . minimum of y o oy 10°x 5, 4
B12-48 x 31 0”) sided box R 14’ x6’, 4 .
” 12°’x 5, 4 . sided box
0”) culvert) ided b sided box lvert
ALTERNATE sided box B culvert)
culvert)
Mack Industries,
Inc.
. . . $31,584 or $31,050 or $52,260 or $26,432 or
201 Columbia Rd. No bid No bid ! X ' !
Valley City, OH $658 per LF $575 per LF $871 per LF $472 per LF
44280
Prestress
Services
/2:/2 - partord $54,600 or |~ $60,900 or No bid No bid No bid No bid
' $7,800 EA $8,700 EA
Ste 310
Columbus, OH
43222

All bids were signed and contained proper surety. | recommend that any informalities be waived and the bid
be awarded to:

Jeff Stauch, PE/PS

County Engineer | Environmental Engineer

Jack Derr, AIA
Chief Building Official

Bill Narducci, PE

Assistant County Engineer



Prestress Services in the amount of $54,600 for proposal TR 267B-0.965 or, alternatively, $60,900 for
proposal TR 267B-0.965 Alternate

Mack Industries, Inc., in the amount of $31,584 for proposal CR 33B-1.966;

Mack Industries, Inc., in the amount of $31,050 for proposal CR 113H-5.469;

Mack Industries, Inc., in the amount of $52,260 for proposal CR 129K-8.135;

Mack Industries, Inc., in the amount of $26,432 for proposal CR 252A-0.832

County Engineer 233 W. Sixth Street P 937.645. 3018
Environmental Engineer Marysville, Ohio 43040 F 937.645. 3161
Building Department WWW.C0.union.oh.us/engineer



