2019 Union County Asphalt Materials Quotations Tabulation
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Oregon, OH 43616 Findlay, OH 45840 Columbus, OH 43223 Ciﬁj4rgb'\1/|1(s:!<gll-?y4g;g4 Hamilton, OH 45015 Cleveland, OH 44105
Contact Phone Number 419-693-0626 419-466-5387 614-437-2359 614-488-7958 513-874-6192 216-441-4880
Contact Name Cameron Porter Scott Rychener Troy Segner Carl Scheiderer Andrew Nortz Donald Kautzman
Belle Center Ostrander 4/30/19 - 12/15/19 12/16/19 - 4/30/20
ITEM 301 Bit Agg Base No Bid $57.00 $58.50 $70.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid
ITEM 302 Bit Agg Base No Bid $57.00 $58.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 ( Int) No Bid $70.00 $71.50 $70.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 2 No Bid $63.00 $64.50 $70.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid
ITEM 441 Type 1 (Surface) No Bid $70.00 $71.50 $70.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Cold Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.00 $110.00 No Bid $110.75
MC-30 $2.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid
RS-2 $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CM-90 $2.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HFRS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRS-2P (SBS) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HFRS-2P (SBR-latex) $1.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.13 No Bid
RS-2P (SBR-latex) $1.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.13 No Bid
CRS-2P (SBR-latex) $1.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.13 No Bid
CSS-1H (50% diluted Fog Seal $1.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.27 No Bid
FAST DRYING FOG SEAL $1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.27 No Bid
Premium for Supply Bond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Demurage Rate 110/hour 110/hr
Edison, Columbus,
Source of Supply Oregon, & Toledo Hamilton Belle Center
5/24/2019




